
Gulf Stream Swimming Pool Heat Pumps  
are covered under the best warranty in 
the industry. With Gulf Stream, enjoy 
ten-years parts and two-years labor. 
See warranty for details.

SWIMMING POOL
HEAT PUMPS

Gulf Stream Heat Pumps are manufactured 
in the USA, and have been family-owned & 
operated in Florida for over 20 years!

EFFICIENCY & RELIABILITY

IMPROVED 
PERFORMANCE

SEE BACK FOR
MORE DETAILS



*All units meet or exceed the AHRI Low (50/63/80) Test Point with a COP of 4.0 or higher

UNIT SPEC HE-110 HE-125 HE-150 HE-125TA HE-150TA
HEAT / COOLHEAT / COOL

Gulfstream provides a no-nonsense 
warranty. No charges for full-warranty
repairs ٢no trip charges٣. Parts are 
warranted for 0׏-years from the
installation date. See warranty for details. 

GULFSTREAM WARRANTY

Gulfstream

Natural Gas

Electrical Resistance

Propane

COST PER MILLION BTUS OF HEAT

* Chart based on $3.00 per gallon LP Gas, $2.20 per therm. of Natural Gas, 13¢ per 
   kilowatt and a heat pump with C.O.P of 6.8 

$40.76

$38.10

$27.50

$5.60

COST OF OPERATION

Quiet

Compatibility

%esigned with your neighbor in mind. 
Ultra-ȴuiet fan & compressor used for
ultra-ȴuiet operation.

Control all Gulfstream Heaters through
any automation or use the built-in display. 

Gulf Streamټs in-house service stands 
behind the longest & strongest warranty 
available in the industry.

Advanced performance testing & superior 
components are designed to last!

The only manufacturer to completely 
run-test every unit produced. Testing
ensures proper performance.

Heat faster for less with highly-optimiɼed
and ef˟ciency-tested Gulf Stream heaters.

Gulf Stream is 20ۑ more ef˟cient than
leading brands. Save 00׏ڡs in costs!

Warranty

Reliability

Performance

FEATURES & BENEFITS
Efficiency

Longevity
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